
Pre-Kindergarten Supply List 2022-2023

Please bring in for the Meet the Teacher event on
Tuesday, September 6th

A change of labeled
clothes
(t-shirt,long-sleeved shirt,
pants/shorts, socks,
underwear, and a spare
pair of shoes)

A small blanket (labeled
with the child's name) that
will stay in your child’s
classroom throughout the
year.  It will be washed
weekly at school.  (A mat
will be provided.)

Paper Towels
(These are suggested  as
the school does provide
rolls of paper towels, but
these work wonders for
those big spills that happen
in preschool as they are
super absorbent!)

Tissues
(These are suggested as
the school does provide
tissues, but we all know we
love ourselves some soft
Kleenex.)

A basic backpack that can
fit a folder

Headphones (Please only
purchase these ones as
many others do not last the
year and/or do not work
well with our iPads)

If you click the image
above, it will take you
directly to Amazon, where
you can order these
yourself.

Or you can send in the
money and I will order
them using my account.

Napkins
(Suggested as the school
provides rolls of paper
towels, but these come in
handy when little hands are
helping pass out snack to
friends… just one of our
classroom jobs.)

Sleeping Eye Mask
(labeled with your child’s
name)

$15.00 to purchase
community classroom
school supplies for the
year.

$15.00 to be split between
snacks for the month of
September for the students
and to help with the costs
of classroom celebrations.

Be sure that the bag with the supplies is labeled (no need to label individual items other than the
clothing and blanket) with your child’s name along with your child’s teacher’s name.

If you have any questions or if you  have financial concerns at it pertains to purchasing these supplies, please reach out to

https://www.amazon.com/dp/B08BF971WF?ref=nb_sb_ss_w_as-reorder-t1_ypp_rep_k1_1_7&amp=undefined&crid=SXF7UN57Y1CJ&sprefix=headpho&th=1


LPyland@lyncourtschool.org.

mailto:LPyland@lyncourtschool.org

